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LEASE 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES, DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE, 

AND FEDERAL HOUSING FINANCE AGENCY 
CIDCAGO,IL 
PIL-01-CH20 

Resolved by the Committee on Tra11sportalio11 and ln.frastructure ofthe U.S. House ofRepresentatives, 
that pursuant to 40 U.S.C. §3307, appropriations are authorized for a lease ofup to 184,042 rentable 
square feet ofspace, including 32 official parking spaces, for the Department ofHealth and Human 
Services, the Department OfCommerce - International Trade Administration, and the Federal Housing 
Finance Agency currently located at 233 N. Michigan Avenue in Chicago, IL, at a proposed total annual 
cost of$7,166,S95 for a lease tenn ofup to 3 years, a prospectus for which is attached to and included in 
this resolution. 

Approval ofthis prospectus constitutes authority to execute an interim lease for all tenants, ifnecessary, 
prior to the execution of the new lease. 

Provided that, the Administrator ofGeneral Services and tenant agency(ies} agree to apply an overall 
utilization rate of328 square feet or less per person, except that, if the Administrator detennines that the 
overall utilization rate cannot be achieved, the Administrator shall provide an explanatory statement to the 
Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House ofRepresentatives prior to exercising any 
lease authority provided in this resolution. 

Provided Jhat,except for interim leases as described above, the Administrator may not enter into any 
leases that are below prospectus level for the purposes ofmeeting any ofthe requirements, or portions 
thereof, included in the prospectus that would result in an overall utilization rate of328 square feet or 
higher per person. 

Provided further, that the General Services Administration shall not delegate to any other agency the 
authority granted by this resolution. 

Provided further, that the Administrator shall require that the delineated area ofthe procurement is 
identical to the delineated area included in the prospectus, except that, ifthe Administrator determines 
that the delineated area ofthe procurement should not be identical to the delineated area included in the 
prospectus, the Administrator shall provide an explanatory statement to the Committee on Transportation 
and Infrastructure ofthe House ofRepresentatives prior to exercising any lease authority provided in this 
resolution. 



Provided further, not later than 30 calendar days after the date on which a request from the Chainnan or 
Ranking Member of the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure ofthe House ofRepresentatives 
is received by the Administrator ofGeneral Services, the Administrator shall provide such Member a 
response in writing that provides any infonnation requested regarding the project. 

Provided further, the Administrator ofGeneral Services may not enter into this lease if it does not contain 
a provision barring any individual holding a Federally-elected office, regardless ofwhether such 
individual took office before or after execution ofthis lease, to directly participate in, or benefit from or 
under this lease or any part thereof and that such provision provide that if this lease is found to have been 
made in violation ofthe foregoing prohibition or it is found that this prohibition has been violated during 
the tenn ofthe lease, the lease shall be void, except that the foregoing limitation shall not apply if the 
lease is entered into with a publicly-held corporation or publicly-held entity for the general benefit ofsuch 
corporation or entity. 

Provided further, prior to entering into this lease or approving a novation agreement involving a change 
ofownership under this lease, the Administrator ofGeneral Services shall require the offeror or the 
parties requesting the novation, as applicable, to identify end disclose whether the owner ofthe leased 
space, including an entity involved in the financing thereof, is a foreign person or a foreign-owned entity; 
provided further, in such an instance, the Administrator of General Services shall notify the occupant 
agency{ies) in writing, end consult with such occupant agency{ies) regarding security concerns and 
necessary mitigation measures {ifany) prior to award ofthe lease or approval ofthe novation agreement. 

Provided that, to the maximum extent practicable, the Administrator ofGeneral Services shall require that 
the lease procurement consider the availability ofpublic transportation consistent with agency mission 
requirements and that the space to be leased be renovated for all cost effective improvements, including 
renewable energy upgrades, water efficiency improvements, end indoor air quality optimization, that 
reduce greenhouse gas emissions. 




